AS INTRODUCED IN THE RAJYA SaBHA
oN THE 10TH M ARcH, 2017

Bill No. L XXIV of 2016

THERIGHT OF CHILDREN TO FREEAND COMPUL SORY
EDUCATION (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2016

A
BILL
further to amend the Right of Children to Free and Compulsory Education Act, 2009.
BEe it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as

follows—

1. (1) ThisAct may be called the Right of Children of Free and Compulsory Education  short title and
(Amendment) Act, 2016 commencement.

5 (2) 1t shall comeinto force on such date asthe Central Government may, be notification
inthe Official Gazette, appoint.

35 of 2009. 2. Inthe Right of Children to Free and Compulsory Education Act, 2009 (hereinafter Amendment
referred to asthe principal Act), in Section 2,— of Section 2.

(a) in clause (c), for the words "six to fourteen years', the words "three to
10 eighteen years' shall be substituted;



Amendment
of Section 3.

Amendment
of Section 4.

Amendment
of Section 8.

Amendment
of Section 9.

(b) in clause (n), after the word "imparting" the words "pre-school education
and" shall be inserted.

3. In section 3 of the principal Act, for the words "six to fourteen years', the words
"three to eighteen years' shall be substituted.

4. In section 4 of the principal Act, for the words "child above six years of age," the
words "child above three years of age" shall be substituted.

5. In section 8 of the principal Act, in clause (), for the Explanation thefollowing shall
be substituted namely:—

“Explanation— The term “compulsory education” means obligation of the
appropriate Government to—

(i) provide free pre-school education and elementary school education to
every child of the age of three to eighteen years; and

(i) ensure compul sory admission, attendance and compl etion of pre-school
education and elementary education by every child of the age of threeto eighteen
years."

6. In section 9 of the principa Act, in clause (d) for thewords‘‘ up to the age of fourteen
years’, the words ** up to the age of eighteen years” shall be substituted.

10

15



STATEMENT OF OBJECTSAND REASONS

Indiabeing the signatory to the United Nations Convention on the Rights of the Child
(UNCRC), had committed to Article 28 of the UNCRC, made it incumbent on the State to
provide elementary education compulsory and freeto al. Thefoundation of schoolingislaid
intheearly years between the ages of threeto six years. Theseearly yearsare regarded asthe
foundation yearsand critical for mental and emotional development of achild. The agegroup
issignificant for brain development and sets the foundation for sound and basic learning in
later years. Hence, it is proposed that minimum age of childernisto be reduced from six to
three years so that this important age group is covered under the Right to Education Act.
Moreover, the existing school system in our country consists from elementary to plus two,
accordingly, the maximum age of children for free and compulsory education be enhanced
from fourteen to eighteen years.

Hence, thisBill.
DR.T. SUBBARAMI REDDY



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Section 7 of the principal Act makes it obligatory for the Central and State
Governments to provide funds for carrying out provisions of the Act. The proposed
amendments as given in clauses of the Bill lowersthe entry level age from 6 to 3 years and
increases the maximum age limit from 14 to 18 years of every child for free and compul sory
education, thereby increasing the financial burden of the Central Government. The Bill, if
enacted, would involve additiona expenditure from the Consolidated Fund of Indiaanditis
very difficult to estimate the expenditure at thisjuncture as the same would depend upon the
number of students added by the proposed amendment of the Act. No non-recurring
expenditureislikely to beinvolved.



ANNEXURE

ExTtrACTS FROM THE RIGHT OF CHILDREN TO FREE AND COMPULSORY
EpucationAcr, 2009

(ActNo. 350r 2009)

* * * * * *

2. In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,—

* * * * * *

(c) "child" meansamale or female child of the age of six to fourteen years;

* * * * * *

(n) "School" means any recognized school imparting elementary education and
includes—

* * * * * *

3. (1) Every Child of the age of six to fourteen years shall have aright to free and
compulsory education in a neighbourhood school till completion of elementary education.

* * * * * *

4. Where achild above six years of age has not been admitted in any school or though
admitted, could not complete his or her elementary education, then, he or she shall be
admitted in a class appropriate to his or her age:

* * * * * *

8. The appropriate Government shall—

(a) provide free and compul sory elementary education to every child:

* * * * * *
Explanation.—The term "compulsory education" means obligation of the
appropriate Government to—

(i) provide free elementary education to every child of the age of six to
fourteen years; and

(i) ensure compul sory admission, attendance and compl etion of elementary
education by every child of the age of six to fourteen years;

* * * * * *

9. Every local authority shall—

* * * * *

(d) maintain records of children up to the age of fourteen years residing within
itsjurisdiction, in such manner as may be prescribed,;

* * * * * *

Definitions.

Right of child
to free and
compulsory
education.

Specia
provisions for
children not
admitted to, or
who have not
completed,
elementary
education.

Duties of

appropriate
Government.

Duties of local
authority.



RAJYA SABHA

A

BILL

further to amend the Right of Children to Free and Compulsory Education Act, 2009.

(Dr. T. Subbarami Reddy, M.P.)

GMGIPMRND—4945RS(S3)—10.03.2017.




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /All
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents for quality printing on desktop printers and proofers.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /NA
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles true
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /NA
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


